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__________________________________ __________________________ 

COBRA Election Form 
(Excerpt from the 2001 Final COBRA Regulations effective January 10, 2001) 

Group health plans maintained by an employer that had fewer than 20 employees on a typical business day in the previous calendar year are not subject 
to COBRA. The 1999 proposed regulations relating to plans maintained by an employer with fewer than 20 employees in the previous calendar year are 
adopted as final regulations without change. Unlike the 1987 proposed regulations, the 1999 proposed regulations use a full-time equivalency method in 
counting part-time employees for purposes of determining if an employer had fewer than 20 employees. 

The 1987 proposed regulations contained rules about how to count part-time employees. An example can be used to illustrate how the 1987 rules were 
proposed to apply. In a calendar year two employers each employ 15 full-time employees and 12 part-time employees. Each part-time employee works 
15 hours per week. Each employer has six typical business days each week. One employer schedules all 12 of the part-time employees to work two-
and-a-half hours each typical business day per week. The other employer staggers the schedule of the part-time employees so that they each work 
seven-and-a-half hours on two typical business days per week, so that four part-time employees work on each typical business day. Under the 1987 
proposed regulations, the part-time employees of the first employer counted as 12 employees whereas the part-time employees of the second employer 
counted only as four employees. In the following calendar year, a group health plan maintained by the first employer would have been subject to 
COBRA (because the first employer employed 27 employees on a typical business day in the preceding calendar year) but a group health plan 
maintained by the second employer would not have been subject to COBRA (because the second employer employed only 19 employees on a typical 
business day in the preceding calendar year). 

The exception for employers with fewer than 20 employees reflects Congress’ judgment that the costs and administrative burden associated with 
COBRA should not be imposed on small employers and that imposing such requirements on small employers may discourage them from providing 
group health coverage to their employees. There is no reason to distinguish, as the approach in the 1987 proposed regulations would have done, 
between two employers with identical numbers of full-and part-time employees based on the particular days that the part-time employees work. 

In contrast to the result under the 1987 proposed regulations, the 1999 proposed regulations and these final regulations provide for the uniform 
treatment of employers employing the same number of part-time employees for equivalent periods, regardless of how the hours are scheduled. The full-
time equivalency approach therefore avoids creating an incentive for employers to schedule the work of their part-time employees in a manner that is 
inconsistent with the convenience of the employees or the needs of the business. 

On an individual basis, the number of part-time employees is computed by dividing the hours worked by each part-time employee by the hours required 
to be considered working full-time and then by adding all the quotients together. On an aggregate basis, the number of part-time employees is computed 
by adding all the hours worked by part-time employees and dividing that sum by the number of hours required for one worker to be considered working 
full-time. Because the two methods produce identical results, both methods are permissible. 

An employer may determine the number of its employees on a daily basis or a pay period basis. The basis used by the employer must be used with 
respect to all employees of the employer and must be used for the entire year for which the number of employees is being determined. If an employer 
determines the number of its employees on a daily basis, it must determine the actual number of full-time employees on each typical business day and 
the actual number of part-time employees and the hours worked by each of those part-time employees on each typical business day. Each full-time 
employee counts as one employee on each typical business day and each part-time employee counts as a fraction, with the numerator of the fraction 
equal to the number of hours worked by that employee and the denominator equal to the number of hours that must be worked on a typical business day 
in order to be considered a full-time employee. If an employer determines the number of its employees on a pay period basis, it must determine the 
actual number of full-time employees employed during that pay period and the actual number of part-time employees employed and the hours worked 
by each of those part-time employees during the pay period. For each day of that pay period, each full-time employee counts as one employee and each 
part-time employee counts as a fraction, with the numerator of the fraction equal to the number of hours worked by that employee during that pay 
period and the denominator equal to the number of hours that must be worked during that pay period in order to be considered a full-time employee. 
The determination of the number of hours required to be considered a full-time employee is based upon the employer’s employment practices, except 
that in no event may the hours required to be considered a full-time employee exceed eight hours for any day or 40 hours for any week. 

In the case of a multiemployer plan, the determination of whether the plan is a small-employer plan on any particular date depends on which employers 
are contributing to the plan on that date and on the workforce of those employers during the preceding calendar year. If a plan that is otherwise subject 
to COBRA ceases to be a small-employer plan because of the addition during a calendar year of an employer that did not normally employ fewer than 
20 employees on a typical business day during the preceding calendar year, the plan ceases to be excepted from COBRA immediately upon the addition 
of the new employer. In contrast, if the plan ceases to be a small-employer plan by reason of an increase during a calendar year in the workforce of an 
employer contributing to the plan, the plan ceases to be excepted from COBRA on the January 1 immediately following the calendar year in which the 
employer’s workforce increased. 
Is your group required to comply with COBRA law in the current calendar year? Yes No

 a.  If “Yes,” would you like to utilize the services of Ceridian?   Yes No
 b. If you answered “No” for (a.), who will handle COBRA administration for you?  _______________________________  

Group Administrator’s signature Date 
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